
TNI Stationary Source Audit Sample Expert Committee Teleconference 
September 18, 2012, 2:00 PM, EDT 
 
Attendance: 
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TestAmerica (Laboratory) 

Committee member Absent 

Mike Hayes 
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Committee member Absent 
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New Jersey DEP (State government) 

Committee member 
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Theresa Lowe 
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Committee member 
Absent 

Paul Meeter 
Weston Solutions (Stationary Source Tester) 

Committee member Absent 

Gregg O’Neal,  
North Carolina DAQ (State government) 

Committee member Present 

Michael Schapira 
Enthalpy (Laboratory) 

Committee member Absent 

Jim Serne 
TRC Solutions (Stationary Source Tester) 

Committee member Present 

Richard Swartz, Vice-chair 
Missouri DNR (State government) 

Committee member Present 

Stanley Tong 
EPA Region 9 (Federal government) 

Committee member Present 

Ken Jackson 
TNI (Program Administrator) 

Program Administrator 
Absent 

Ty Garber 
Wibby (Provider) 

Associate member 
Absent 

Shawn Kassner 
ERA (Provider) 

Associate member Absent 

Mike Miller 
(Member at large) 

Associate member Absent 

Wayne Stollings (Triangle Env. Services) Guest Present 

William Daystrom 
TNI (Webmaster) 

Guest Present 

Charles Simon (VOC Reporting) Guest Present 

 
1) Double-check receipt of documents to be referenced in this teleconference 

 
All present confirmed receipt of the documents e-mailed September 17, 2012.   
 
 

2) Review and approve minutes from teleconference on September 4, 2012  

 
Jim Serne moved to accept the minutes as written.  We did not vote on the 
minutes as we did not have a quorum.  The minutes will be voted on by e-mail.   
 
 
 



3) Review M25 Subcommittee recommendations 

 
Category #3, item 1 – Charles explained the SSAS table will require the reporting 
of methane (if approved) and CO2 from the audit sample analysis.  Therefore, the 
purpose of this change to the promulgated method is so the method allows for 
the reporting of these constituents.   
 
Category #3, item 2 – Charles summarized the collection system portion of the 
recommendation.  He explained that some audits fail because these procedures 
are not properly followed.  The equipment described is typically required.  There 
was some discussion of what materials are acceptable for use, glass, stainless 
steel, brass, etc…, and what’s not acceptable, Teflon for instance.   
 
Stan asked, regarding 6.4.1, is there something that defines what clean is?  
Charles also indicated there should be a requirement for a stainless steel 
diaphragm in the gas regulator, and a CGA 350 connection.  Charles explained 
that clean would be less than 5ppm.  Purging the regulator with clean air is how 
you clean it.  A ten minute purge should be adequate.  This section should have 
a specification on what clean is.   
 
Regarding the same section, Gregg asked if we need to specify what type of 
regulator is required?  Charles indicated the size should have no effect.   
 
Charles & Wayne will re-write section 6.4.1 and add specifications regarding 
cleanliness of the regulator, and require a stainless steel diaphragm and a CGA 
350 connection.  They will also add any other specifics they feel are appropriate.   
 
It was discussed that typically the laboratory will be providing the set up 
(regulator, etc…), however, some folks will want to use their own equipment, 
therefore, the specifications need to be in the federal register.   
 
There was some discussion of the appropriate CGA connection for this 
application, and if the 350 is the best option.  It was decided to stick with the 350.   
 
Charles summarized the audit collection procedure in the recommendation.  
Charles indicated he and Wayne will add language to 8.5.6 requiring the 
monitoring of excess flow and other sampling parameters typically recorded 
during sample collection.   
 
Category #3, item 3 – Charles summarized the recommendation.  He explained 
their field sample study results were much better when they used a blank and 
were able to correct based on the blank results.  This is because there is a 
background concentration, and contamination, that should be accounted for.  For 
audit samples below 50 ppm a blank correction is very necessary.   
 
Charles further explained that the trip blank, if it’s on dry ice, will pick up some 
contamination during transport & storage prior to delivery to the laboratory.   



 
Regarding the upper limit allowed for blank correction, there was some 
discussion of including the equivalent concentration in parts per million as carbon 
(ppmc) in the language.  This would be consistent with the SSAS table in that the 
Method 25 acceptance criteria concentrations in the table are expressed in 
ppmc.  There was some concern and discussion about how the volume of a 
sample would affect concentrations.   
 
Charles indicated they conducted a statistical evaluation to come up with the 
maximum blank concentrations allowed.  These concentrations are based on the 
actual mass of VOC’s in a 5 liter sample volume.   
 
It was further discussed that the laboratory will calculate the blank corrected VOC 
values in their report as opposed to the stack testing company calculating the 
blank corrected value.   
 
Michael Klein reminded us that the reason we are considering blanks is so the 
acceptance criteria can be tightened.  We need to keep that in mind as we 
discuss this topic.   
 
In summary, it was noted that Charles and Wayne are going to work on 
amending the language in items 2 & 3 of category #3.  They will have that done 
before the next meeting which will be in two weeks.  As there is not a quorum 
present at this meeting, decisions regarding acceptance or rejection of the 
recommendations will be held off until the next meeting.   
 
At this time Stan Tong took the floor and informed us of discussions he had with 
EPA’s Office of Enforcement, Compliance, and Assistance (OECA).  OECA 
would like to take a look at a sample of our recommendations so they can decide 
what would constitute a change in the guidance document or a change in the 
CFR.  Stan would be willing to provide this to them at some point.  In addition, 
instead of updating the guidance document, EPA would be more likely to add an 
addendum to the guidance document.   
 
Charles indicated he is in agreement that an addendum would be good, or even 
an alternate method as the CFR is difficult to change.   
 
The meeting is adjourned.  The next meeting will be October 2, 2012, 2:00 PM 
EDT.   
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